& TR Wl IR TF
ofoied, & I3 HHiE 22/153,

feiw 10-1-06 g @ Y=

H. ¥.-108-I9e1-09-11.

TSI ST =44 1 4 St I(? 5 -
= g W IR ¥ A I =
wi%s 182] W, FER, fAiF 27 9 2010—37 6, Y 1932

fafy ik faurh =@ faum

figre, fEid 9 A 0%0

%, 3093-230-FFRIW-H-(W.).— w9y faum aw & Frefafga sfufmam @ ® feaiw L& 7, 020 &t
wEmiEn TgUfa F A W § TR ¥, WEN F-uRoL H IEER & el yafa fem s .

TR F U & 9 ¥ 991 JRIER,
TRV qeE, W FiEa.

weayey fufram

®Hi® 9 T 0%0.

URAT & ( WeaweyT |yner ) Afufam, 008,

aRTE
g. dfga M.
R
3 YR R 1 WA,
¥. YT 33 1 G
. YR 4R 1 G,
€. YA 43 F G,
9, YR 4R-F F1 T,
£, YR 43 & 9.
L B U €3 F GO,
Ro. T R &&-F F| I A
2%, MR &¢ W T,
3. HRT o HI YA,
3. Y & 1 YA,
6. YR 9o H HEHA

s et

AR T F @] §U T § 7 afufrm, 2930 F G, 18 # GO



'@*\m Ty T, S 27 W 2010
| e s

FH® 9 T 020

YRA a7 ( Heayeyr @y ) rfufam, 008,

[foaiw tg wrd, R0%0 Y wafr At iy war g el ¢ e werw (srmuRer)”, # R e W,
0%0 F WUW AR VTR @t . ]

ey T 1 AR T ®U ¥ uwelg a1 Afufam, 220 i ik dvifim &1 g afufrm,

mwmtm#aﬁﬁqwm.ﬁm—mmﬁqﬁiﬁmmﬁw
Hfufafia & —

wiyw . 2. 30 Afufem w1 dfa T Wl 39 (wawey weE) sifufEm, 00) R

TERE AR 3 e T W N §C WU F MR @ sfufRm, 1339 (3%%9 W W, 28)

s, (T T TR sfufrm % R fifde ) B ved ok wa It i A wfe
]9 w . t8  foRa S,

T WYL

T (3. 9 SfufEs #1 9/ 3E I (2) ¥, IR TS TR TR F WA W, I I5E
|, TR TR wfya Rl S —

4T 33 ®T ¥, g aifufEe #t u@ 33 & 3T (R) § I V'@ TR TR F WA W, 9% CUSE
Wi, TR T wfiE fRY ST

AT 4t ®T . q& tfufem it g o i IR (R) b, IR TF R TR F WA W, I IR
. TR T i fRd

URT 4R T €. ga afufam = a4 49—

wein.

(TF) I9UR (R) & A R, Frefafaa s wnfe 1 s, sl —

“(r) 4 e favem A 1 FR0 @ fF e omfye @1 ok Wi @1 @ @=-
I % FaN § B 1 Y few T §, 99 99309 el wwa siem,
T, qF, &, S A Rl o el #, foe welm @ sqay S s
¥ fea m R, fet 9 afie @ qfem afisrdt g afinde fen wn
THm. "

(@) UM (y) ¥ N, Frefafea soumd et s, sl —

() afER weEf, Wi SR ¥ aew # e WivER BRI € o
7 IWF N EION A FHEE YN HE B FeEy F ogia qw, 7H Y
o R A, 4R W-F F o awfafed arfiwean F o @R

(v) & T @i v @A A wivga afuer), sfimew § @1 s=wm 3§
4 F=dfad &, 98 e 3= WiUE 3@ 9 % aiE sdafedl ¥ @een
F fod 36 9ot & e e arfusrd <1 wmen sl & am.”



negyRy Tavd, feis 27 w2010 £

o o fufEm F U WR-F §, IR () 0 IR (5) §, W= e F oy’ O W-F W
¥ W W, v Wivga s ¥ o’ T ey . i

@ ’-”J—gj

¢. 7@ dfufEm F 90 43 F @wF ®, fraffed oo w@ifia $ow, sl - U w3 w7

43 R 9§ A= dfe aen S8 99 fuer, e o fomd e 3 v R F
i w¢ Sfom, TE, M I A ag AW H R, @ wn e m‘;ﬂg
Hofe B UR R o WGA AER W AT F wnE, S 96 AW F 2 e,
foad o Afirgw fF w8, ferw w0 9t afeRa @ @), 59 W
aifim &), 99 ¥ 3 @ AfuFR gR AW ewla T Hufd % g F e
F W @ R, W oy #, S fE fafe e s wfgfa @ sed @it
W e F1 | IR fofs = owdm

% @ Hfufrem F a6 ¥, W= o FrEE B, e ey Jad o R A w0, e o3 w
T R R, W A e QM F W W, 9= e FREW Q, faw ey o A @ e,
FA WG AN TF D W R Y N U TR Y w A
B, W I Q, TS T e e W,

2o, T@ fufm &t ¥y &g F e, Frafafea 78 R smavafim &6t s, swiq — T U e8-®
T =,
“te-%. 1 Afe, S I AfUFEE W IFF AR IR T P ¥ fRET STEdl # sw @ wae
I FA F WA FOT 9 IqF Ieelvd A FGH T4, IqF A A qg T THEW
guzn smem fF 3 ¥A SwEdl @ fradl & Iooe fem R

2. & sfufram N ¥R ¢ F R R, Frafafes yro wfia 6t s, stafq — a8 ®T
.
‘/“ac.(z)mm,mﬁm@mm,ﬁﬁﬂaqaﬁmﬂﬁmam%mm TRt &t o

(%) fodt @ =fw , fous forg a8 gfegs o3 faaam € & 37 w1
oy &3 ¥ fafifde sy @ fim 98 7 sy fean €, 39 s F
fo, foad M ¥ 7@ WE ¥ 5 I YO o fe €, wfaam & w0 o

(@) & FE gwfa vz feg M F e R F s afnEk w=
™ 2, @ wfaa wived gu afuew & sRw wfw fey s F @ W@
sfirt gR1 AN TEEfo SEF ged # e W fRd W W, 3@ gufa @

i

() @ i F, gufeafs O v @ @ e, @1 A F g fer WA W,
Hfey =afqa 1, afg a9 sfiren o & 3=iifea = foar smom, ik sifingeta. 1
T wfy, afe % D, frfs = & ol o W@ =fe @ T i § faeg
A HE FrEfaRT TE S S,

(3)  ®E o 99 fusit 39 U F vl 99 9% G T8l B S« aw fF 9w TR
#t ifem | o dfm w1 a9 syt 7@ ®, ok Swum () ¥ @R (F) F



\2

364(2)

TegRY o9, A 27 W 2010

JT W& &®/T
AU

URT 99 /T

Hyih.

R F S SRR A S T R R TR d A T S g H
AT A HA T

g Wl 9 I F Ama ¥ fed ddy o 918 orwow fewn mn €, o S w@ER @@t

goafy 78 ¥ W TR o I F ame e U9 O o ¢ q #W @
au afe st 3 wem AR WM e R, @ dfey =fe f s=ifea e
wHm R frEe # T gfy, (37 I A i), 3k #E ¢, <@ wm
F UV ¥ He@ W A ek v F qE@ w), S w9 9, foje St W
&, il & I Faa ot Fofe #t w1 wFh 9@ I ufef WER
#! gofa ¢ ¢ W 99 I9F g W WS W e 9 kL

R %ﬁuﬁmaﬂwez F #[ R, Frafafen o enfa i S, safq —

“\5’

T wER, 1A ¥ aAftgE gr, e R v e wg afrer aifufam, ese
(2¢9 & E. Q) H UK R} ¥ oA Frgm Wl § aea ¥, W ofufram
U wo F v Mg fer T wl@w vy & faw Y i sqpda e smom
3 fF ag 7 wu feg 9 Preafafea @ sfus 7@ @, el —

99 d9g, T, PoX, W, A, ¥, AW,

FH0 I IFF WA A I3 9 F fere————— - T9E 9T :

W fEga # FeEy & A W 9y F W@ & G4 7 qvSafusi gr SEE

& Afafe fram it ™ wefem W w T gm "

3. 4R 9§ H @ (M) ¥F wwEw, Frefafas @vs seanfoa feg <, s —

Y F)ma afufem F a 43 F i afinEta wwfa & fofs feg sm & fag &

1 ol wfayfa &y fafga @ & fa ;

(n-|)3 Afufam @ U ¢o-T F IUUW (3) F AHA 9 Wivwd & AR F

faeg T wwA B W W w7 e gr wivga @ wifted | e
FA Ft Femary R Gfa fafes =01 F fag

aw,tlaquﬁmﬁm-mﬁ,w“wwm“%mw,m“mmw‘:"



7y

Teyey o9, faiw 27 A" 2010 364 (3)

e, f&Aw 27 7, 2010

F. 2074-130-FFHIH-A(. ). — YRA F TUF & T 348 F @IS (3) F I8 H YA 37 (WeAwey geie)
sfufam, 2000 (W% 7 T 2010) &1 iU ARG THANA & WHR |/ TGN Fhifvm fean s €.

TR F THYE F 9 Y A AR,
T AqTEE, FR wia.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No.7 oF 2010.

THE INDIAN FOREST (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2009.

TABLE OF CONTENTS.
Sections :

—
.

Short title.

Amendment of Central Act No. XVI of 1927 in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh.
Amendment of Section 26.

Amendment of Section 33.

Amendment of Section 51.

Amendment of Section 52.

Amendment of Section 52-A.

Substitution of Section 53.

e e R T R T B

* Amendment of Section 63.

...
=)

Insertion of new Section 66-A.

p—
p—

. Substitution of Section 68.

—
(]

. Substitution of Section 71.

[
(")

. Amendment of Section 76.

—_
Ea

Amendment of Section 77.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 7 or 2010.

THE INDIAN FOREST (MADHYA PRADESH AMENDMENT) ACT, 2009.

[Received the assent of the President on the 16th March, 2010; assent first published in the "Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)", dated the 27th March, 2010.]

An Act further to amead the Indian-Forest Act, 1927 -it its application_te-the State of
Madhya Pradesh.



<&
@ 364 (4)

weyew Tadd, f&miw 27 7 2010

Short title.

Amendment of
Central Act No.
XVI of 1927 in its
application to the

State of Madhya
Pradesh.

Amendment of
Section 26.

Amendment of
Section 33.

Amendment of
Section 51.

Amendment -of
Section 52

Amendment of
Section 52-A.

Substitution of
Section 53.
Power to release

property seized
under Section 52.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixtieth year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Indian Forest (Madhya Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2009.

2. The Indian Forest Act, 1927 (No. XVI of 1927) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal
Act), shall, in its application to the State of Madhya Pradesh, be amended in the manner hereinafter
provided.

- 3.7 In sub-section (1) of Section 26 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

_ 4. In sub-section (1) of Section 33 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

5. In sub-section (2) of Section 51 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand
rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

6. In Section 52 of the Principal Act,—
(i) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“(1)  When there is reason to believe that a forest offence has been committed in
respect of any reserved forest and protected forest or forest produce, the
produce, and all tools, boats, vehicles, ropes, chains or any other article used
in committing such offence may be seized by any forest officer or police
officer”

(ii) after sub Section (5), the following sub-sections shall be added, namely :—

“(6)  The seized property shall continue to be under custody until confirmation of
the order of the authorised officer by the Appellate Authority or until the expiry
of the period for initiating ‘suo motu’ action by him whichever is earlier, as
prescribed under Section 52-A.

) Where ‘the authorised officer having jurisdiction over the case is himslef
involved in the, seizure or investigation, the next higher authority may transfer
the case to any other officer of the same rank for conducting proceedings under
this section.”

7. In Section 52-A of the Principal Act, in sub-section (2) and sub-section (6), for the words
“order of confiscation”, the words *“order of the authorised officer” shall be substituted.

8. For Section 53 of l.he Principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“53. Any Forest-officer of a rank not inferior to that of a Ranger, who, or whose
subordinate, has seized any tools, boats, vehicles or any other article under Section
52, may release the same on the execution by the owner thereof, of a security
in a form as may be prescribed, of an amount equal to the value of such property,
as estimated by such officer, for the production of, the property, so released, when
so required, before the authorised officer under Section 52 or the Magistrate
having jurisdiction to try the offence on account of which the seizure has been
made.”.



) 55

quyey T, At 27 7 2010 364 (5)
9. In Section 63 of the principal Act, for the words “shall be punishable with imprisonment for Amendment of
a term which may extend to two years, or with fine, or with both”, the words “shall be punishable with osten €5
imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than six months and may extend to two years, or with
fine not less than five thousand rupees, or with both”, shall be substituted.
10. After Section 66 of the Principal Act, the following new section shall be inserted, namely:— Imcmf new
“66-A. Any person who attempts to contravene or abets the contravention of any provisions ~ Attempt or

of this Act or the rules made thereunder shall be deemed to have contravened such
provisions or rules.”

11. For Section 68 of the Principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“68. (1) The State Government may, by notification in the official Gazette, empower a Forest-
Officer,—

(a) to accept from any person against whom a reasonable suspicion exists that
he has committed any forest offence, other than an offence specified in Section
62 or Section 63, a sum of money by way of compensation for the offence
which such person is suspected to have committed, and

(b) when any property has been seized as liable to confiscation, to release the
same at any time before an order of confiscation is passed by the appropriate
authority, on payment of the value thereof as estimated by such officer.

(V) On the payment of such sum of money, or such value, or both, as the case may
be, to such officer, the suspected person, if in custody, shall be discharged, the
property, if any, seized shall be released, and no further proceedings shall be taken
against such person or property.

3) A Forest-officer shall not be empowered under this section unless he is a Forest-
officer of a rank not inferior to that of a Ranger, and the sum of money accepted
as compensation under clause (a) of sub-section (1) shall in no case be less than
two times the value of the forest produce:

Provided that in case the forest produce in respect of which an offence has been committed
is not the property of the Government or in case the value of the foregt produce
is less than one thousand rupees and, if the offender has committed®he offence
for the first time, the suspected person may be discharged and the property (other
than the forest produce), if any, seized may be released on payment of the sum
of ten thousand rupees or the value of the seized property, whichever is less;
the seized forest produce may be released only it if is not the property of the
Government or on the payment of the value thereof, as the case may be.”

12. For Section 71 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“71.  The State Government may, by notification in the official Gazette, direct that, in
lieu of the fines fixed undr Section 12 of the Cattle-trespass Act, 1871

(1 of 1871), there shall be levied for each head of cattle impounded under

abetmient of an
offence.

Substitution of

Section 68.
Power to

compound
offences.

Substitution of
Section 71.

Power to alter fines
fixed under that
Act.



364 (6)

oYY Ued, feiw 27 Wi 2010

Amendment of
Section 76.

Amendment of
Section 77.

Section 70 of this Act, such fines as it thinks fit, but not exceeding the following,
that is to say :—

For each elephant one thousand rupees

For each camel two hundred and fifty rupees
For each buffalo one hpndred rupees

For each calf, ass, pig, ram, ewe, sheep, fifty rupees:

lamb, goat, kid or any other cattle.

Provided that the cost of maintenace of such cattle during the period of impoundment
shall be recoverable at the prevailing rates as fixed by the Divisional Forest
Officer, in addition to the fine.” '

13. In Section 76, after clause (c), the following clauses shall be inserted, nanwl‘ly —

“(ca)  to prescribe the form of a security to be furnished for release of the seized
property under Section 53 of this Act;

(cb) to prescribe the period and manner of appeal against an order of the Forest
Officer, to the State Government or to such officer as may be authorised by the
State Government in this behalf undr sub-sectiion (3) of Section 80-A of this
Act;”.

14. In Section 77 of the Principal Act, for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “fifteen
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Frdrss, v v A e WO, weavd EN wEEE 3 grener, e A gfia ao swfm—2010



	0228.JPG
	0229.JPG
	0230.JPG
	0231.JPG
	0232.JPG
	0233.JPG
	0234.JPG
	0235.JPG

